
River Junction
Access & Campground
Overview: River Junction is a 12-acre property 
located along the Iowa River in the southern part 
of the county. This property features a primitive 
campground and boat ramp. River Junction is 
bordered by the Iowa River to the west. Just a 
few hundred feet south of the park, the English 
River flows into the Iowa, and the confluence 
serves as the park’s namesake. Mature trees 
provide shaded relief and make this area a 
peaceful oasis for campers and anglers alike. 
River Junction Access & Campground is along 
the Iowa River Water Trail. The Johnson County 
segment of the Iowa River Water Trail starts at 
Sturgis Ferry Park in Iowa City and ends at the 
Tri-County Bridge at the southern corner of the 
county. Paddlers can enjoy a 9.8-mile distance 
from Hills Access to River Junction Access.  

History: Johnson County Conservation 
acquired this property in 1971. 

Features: Facilities on the site include the boat 
ramp, picnic tables, ten primitive campsites and 
a latrine. 

The camping fee is $10 per unit per night for 
each of the 11 campsites with fire rings.
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